Bid Tab Sheet

City of Sparta
YMCA Pool Resurface Bid
2:00 p.m. Jan 30th, 2025

Adams IVIaaTSon IVTaOTSon IVTaaTSon
Baynum | Swimming |DWR Aquatics Inc. |DWR Aquatics Inc. |DWR Aquatics Inc. |DWR Aquatics Inc. Swimming Swimming Swimming
Vendor Pool Option 1 Option 2 Option 3 Option 4 Eaton Const. Pools Opt #1 [Pools Opt #2 |Pools Opt #3
No Bid | No Bid
Bid Total S 238,409.00 | $ 115,258.00 | $ 111,300.00 | $ 102,201.00 | $ 213,000.00 [ S 116,000.00 | $ 130,500.00 | S 103,750.00
Type of Diamond Brite Blue
Material PVC Membrane Hydrazzo Quartz Marcite Plaster Diamond Brite Diamond Brite |Hydrazzo White Plaster
5yr. Manufacture; Manufacture; 1
Manufacture's; lyr. 10yr Manu; 1yr |yr.
Warranty 15 yr. Warranty 10 yr. Warranty 5 yr. Warranty |2 yr. Warranty 1lyr Workmanship |Workmanship  |Workmanship |Workmanship
New lanes
Racing Tile installed at No Included in Bid Included in Bid [Included in Bid [Included in Bid
Installed Cost Cost S 21,490.00 | S 21,490.00 | $ 21,490.00 |Price Price Price Price
Can remain and be [Can remain and be [Can remain and be
Current Racing Re-Grouted during |Re-Grouted during |Re-Grouted during Chip out Chip out Chip out
Tile process process process existing Tile existing Tile  [existing Tile
Start 2 wks of Start 2 wks of Start 2 wks of Start 2 wks of
award completed |award completed [award completed [award completed [Begin 2 to 4
in 30 Days weather [in 30 Days weather |in 30 Days weather [in 30 Days weather |weeks after PO |6 weeks after |6 weeks after |6 weeks after
Time permitting permitting permitting permitting issued Po issued Po issued Po issued
Total Bid with . .
Racing Stripes No Bid| No Bid S 238,409.00 | S 136,748.00 | S 132,790.00 | $ 123,691.00 |$ 213,000.00 |$ 116,000.00 | $ 130,500.00 (| $ 103,750.00
Meets Specs? N/A N/A Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

RFB's were sent to 8 vendors.
from 3 vendors were received. Apparent

8 Bids

Low bid was within specs.




