City of Sparta Chemical Bid Tab

June 6th 2023

for July - Dec 2023
A B C D E F
ITEM AULICK | BRENNTAG Univar DYCHO  |Citco Water
Solutions
$3.67/gal | $3.70 /gal (Wed | $4.31/gal
{Sibelco | Delivery, 12 Drum| {in 50 gal
No Bid $4.24/gal  |/PCS Sales) Min) drum)
$2.37/ gal $3.40 /gal (7
Min Order working day ARO,
No Bid 1600 gal No Bid 1600 gal min) $3.60 /gal
$0.483 /b (2.5%
Fuel Surcharge, 74
14 WD AROQ,
No Bid No Bid No Bid 46,000lb min} No Bid
Chlorine 150 Ib cylinders/Ib.
$1.70 /b (Wed $1.58 /b
5 No Bid No Bid No Bid Del, 2 cyl min) | {150Ib Cyl}
Sulfur Dioxide 150 Ib cylinders/lb.
$1.70 fib (Wed $1.32/1b
6 No Bid $1.59/ b No Bid Del, 2 cyl min) | (150Ib Cyl)
$23.95 /gal (7-14 | $46.45/ gal
Superfloc C-1598/Gal. (Polymer) $20.59/ gal | WD ARO, 1 drum (55 gal
7 No Bid $24.39/ gal {Kemira) min} drum)
$2.74 /gal (14 $3.43/ gal
Bioxide/Gal. (Calcium Nitrate} day ARO, 46,000 | (del in330
$2.85/gal Ib min, 3 stops gal
8 (Nitra-Nox) No Bid No Bid incl) increment)
$3.60/ gal
$3 29 /gal (Wed {50 gal
9 No Bid $3.45/ gal $5.41/ gal | Del, 8 drum min) drum)
$2.25/1b
$2.69/1b (Wed (100 Ib
10 No Bid $2.14/ b §2.58/lb | del, 1 drum min) drum}
$0.40 /b (Wed $0.58 /b
11 No Bid $0.4280/ b No Bid del, 1 drum min) |{525/b drum)
12
13 WasteWater Treatment Plant *Apparent low bid did not meet specs
14 **Apparent low bid required too large of Minimum Order, no storage room
§ All Bid Prices are Honored until the Prices go up on the company's end.
15 Then a contract negation wili take place.
16

17

Bid packets were sent to 11 vendors. "No Bids" were received from 6 vendors.
Preliminary low bids are highlighted in yellow. Bids will he awarded after specs are
approved by Plant operators.




